
25 Mixing Tips For Modern Electronic Music
Production
Mixing is an essential part of the music production process. It's the process
of blending and balancing the individual tracks of your song to create a
cohesive and polished final mix. A good mix will make your song sound
more professional, clear, and impactful.
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If you're new to mixing, or if you're looking to improve your skills, then this
book is for you. In this book, I'll share 25 of my favorite mixing tips that will
help you take your mixes to the next level.

1. Start with a clean slate

Before you start mixing, it's important to make sure that your individual
tracks are clean and free of any unwanted noise or distortion. This will give
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you a solid foundation to work from and will help you avoid problems down
the road.

2. Use a reference track

When you're mixing, it's helpful to have a reference track to compare your
mix to. This will help you stay on track and make sure that your mix is
sounding as good as it can.

3. EQ your tracks

EQ is one of the most important tools in the mixing process. It allows you to
control the frequency content of your tracks and make sure that they're all
sitting in their own space.

4. Compress your tracks

Compression is another essential mixing tool. It allows you to reduce the
dynamic range of your tracks and make them sound louder and more
consistent.

5. Use reverb and delay

Reverb and delay are two effects that can add depth and space to your
mixes. They can help to create a sense of atmosphere and make your
tracks sound more cohesive.

6. Automte your mix

Automation is a powerful tool that allows you to control the volume, pan,
and other parameters of your tracks over time. This can help you create
dynamic and interesting mixes.



7. Master your mix

Mastering is the final step in the mixing process. It involves making final
adjustments to your mix to ensure that it sounds its best on all playback
systems.

8. Get feedback

Once you've finished your mix, it's a good idea to get feedback from others.
This can help you identify areas that need improvement and make sure that
your mix is sounding its best.

9. Practice makes perfect

Mixing is a skill that takes time and practice to master. The more you mix,
the better you'll become at it. So don't be afraid to experiment and try new
things. The more you practice, the better your mixes will sound.

10. Use a good set of headphones

When you're mixing, it's important to use a good set of headphones. This
will allow you to hear all of the details in your mix and make sure that it's
sounding its best.

11. Take breaks

Mixing can be a mentally and physically demanding task. It's important to
take breaks throughout the process to avoid burnout and keep your ears
fresh.

12. Don't be afraid to make mistakes

Mixing is a process of trial and error. Don't be afraid to make mistakes. The
more you experiment, the more you'll learn.



13. Have fun

Mixing should be enjoyable. If you're not having fun, then you're not ng it
right. So relax, have fun, and enjoy the process.

Bonus tips

Here are a few bonus tips that will help you take your mixes to the next
level:

Use a mixing template

Use sidechain compression

Experiment with different panning techniques

Use parallel processing

Master your mix in multiple formats

Mixing is an essential part of the music production process. By following
these tips, you can take your mixes to the next level and create
professional-sounding tracks.

So what are you waiting for? Start mixing today!
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